
 

UMS FKAL Students Embrace Confident 
Communication Skills in Exclusive Session with  

Labuan Toastmasters Club 
 

 “Unleash your potential: Speaking and 
presenting with confidence is a seminar 
conducted in conjunction with the UMS 
Tamu Gadang – a series of dynamic 
student-organized events, including 
competitions, exhibitions, sales stalls, 
and performances that serves as a 
prelude to the upcoming 25th UMS 
Convocation to be held to the main 
campus in Kota Kinabalu from 11th – 
13th November 2023. Two distinguished 
toastmasters (DTM) from Labuan 
Toastmasters Club, a body that is well-
known for its proficiency in refining 
presentation and public speaking 
abilities shared their knowledge, 
expertise, and experience during the 
engaging event. Clarence Tessensohn, 
the current president and Susanna Koh, 
vice president of the Labuan 
Toastmasters Club discussed important 
topics such as speech preparation and 
content, building self- confidence, 

guidelines for impromptu speaking, speaking in front of the recording device, responding to 
challenging questions, and some take-home tips on delivering quality speech.   
 

 

 


